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First Time and Repeat HSR Classic Daytona presented by IMSA Winners Crowned after Competitive 
and Dramatic Classic 24 Hour Race at Daytona International Speedway

Historic Sportscar Racing

DAYTONA BEACH, Florida (November 
6, 2022) - Close finishes and dominating 
performances combined for a dramatic and 
competitive eighth running of the Historic 
Sportscar Racing (HSR) Classic Daytona 
presented by IMSA which came to a safe 
and successful conclusion Sunday after 24 
hours of top-tier vintage and historic sports 
car racing on the 3.56-mile road course at 
Daytona International Speedway (DIS).

The action in the combined Run Groups 
C and D rounds stood out as two of the 
most exciting and dramatic races on the 
weekend. Cal Meeker turned in the come-
back performance of this year's HSR Clas-
sic 24 with a no-quit drive to take overall 
Group C honors in his 1987 No. 129 Spice 
SE87L. After falling six laps down due to 
an issue in Saturday afternoon's opening 
session, Meeker steadily moved back up to 
the front in the remaining three Group C 
races. He made up the final two laps in the 
last round to move into first place with only 
a few minutes left on the clock to seal his 
first HSR Classic Daytona 24 victory.

The accompanying Group D race 
was equally thrilling as some quick and 
immaculately-prepared GT machines upset 
the Prototype ranks for the second-straight 
year. The overall victory went to the Iconic 
Racing 2003 No. 163 Saleen S7-R of 
Gérard Lopez and former Le Mans 24 Hour 
winner Éric Hélary. It was the first HSR 
Classic Daytona victory for Hélary and the 
Saleen team while Lopez picked his second 
Classic 24 win to go with his Group A vic-
tory in 2017.

The Saleen's biggest challenger was 
the big-bore 1993 Chevy Camaro R&S of 
Kenny Bupp and Jordan Bupp. The Bupp 
Motorsports team restored the Camaro to 
the exact specifications and livery of Riley 
& Scott GT/Trans-Am Chassis No. 26 that 
was co-driven to the American GT (AGT) 
class win in the 2001 Rolex 24 At Daytona 
by Kenny Bupp and three co-drivers. The 
team nearly pulled off a repeat win 21 
years on but ultimately crossed the finish 
line just over 40 seconds behind the Saleen.

Group E produced another dramatic 
finish tinged with huge heartbreak for the 
Hudson Historics 2014 No. 33 Corvette 
Daytona Prototype of John Reisman and 

Eric Curran. The overall and GT Group E 
victory went to the Turner Motorsport 2010 
No. 96 BMW Z4 GT3 of Vincent Barletta 
and Robby Foley who inherited the lead 
and ultimate overall victory just seven 
minutes from the end of the fourth and final 
Group E round Sunday morning.

Reisman and Curran were cruising with a 
two-lap cushion after dominating Group E 
from the start but slowed with an overheat-
ing engine just a few laps from the finish 
to give the win to the quick BMW. Barletta 
and Foley won in GT for the second year 
in a row but the overall Group E win was 
the first in "HSR Classics" competition for 
both drivers and the Turner Motorsport 
team.

Reisman, Curran and the No. 33 team 
were still credited with the Group E Proto-
type class win that served as some consola-
tion for the late-race disappointment.

Group B saw one of the most dominat-
ing drives in this year's HSR Classic 24 by 
a familiar team and drivers that know how 
to win in HSR Classics competition. The 
Phil Reilly and Co. 1974 No. 26 Chevron 
B26 of Gray Gregory, Ethan Shippert and 
Randy Buck swept all four Group B rounds 
and sealed a record sixth HSR Classics race 
win. The victory was the second for the No. 
26 team and drivers in the HSR Classic 24 
to go along with their 2020 win at Daytona, 
and they also secured four-straight HSR 
Classic Sebring 12 Hour Group victories 
from 2017 to 2020.

Recently crowned IMSA WeatherTech 
SportsCar LMP2 Champion John Farano 
continued to roll in 2022 with an HSR 
Classic 24 victory in Group F in his 2018 
No. 81 Oreca 07 4200. Farano evenly split 
the four Group F race wins with the GMT 
Racing 2007 No. 18 Pescarolo 01 Judd of 

reigning class winners Juan Gonzalez and 
Butch Leitzinger, but the No. 81 team and 
Farano skillfully managed the clock to stay 
on top of the overall standings from the 
opening round on. The No. 18 Pescarolo 
team finished first in rounds two and four 
but some lost time in race three that they 
could ultimately not make up.

Group A went to another first-time HSR 
Classic 24 winner with the debuting Jack 
Lewis Enterprises 1971/20 No. 29 Bailey 
Porsche 917/R tribute car of Jack Lewis 
and Rob Parker scoring a convincing vic-
tory. Parker and the Bailey 917/R team 
won an HSR Classics race for the first time 
while Lewis secured a second-straight HSR 
Classic Daytona victory after scoring the 
Group B GT-class win last year in his Jack 
Lewis Enterprises 1974 No. 9 Porsche 911 
RSR.


